
Canvale Full Privacy Policy 
The information in this website is provided “as is” without warranty of any kind, either 
express or implied, including but not limited to, the implied warranty of 
merchantability, fitness for a particular purpose and non-infringement. Canvale shall 
not be responsible for any errors, omissions or technical inaccuracies in this website. 

This website is primarily for the benefit and use of Canvale customers and potential 
customers. Canvale is constantly improving its products and services and reserves 
the right to make such improvements or changes to this website, the materials, 
products, services or prices posted in this website without prior notice as it deems 
necessary. 

As a convenience to you, Canvale may provide links to Web sites operated by 
others. Canvale makes no representations about Web sites accessed from this 
website which is not maintained, controlled or created by Canvale and does not 
endorse any linked websites or the information appearing thereon. Links do not imply 
that Canvale endorses, is affiliated with or associated with such linked websites. 

Canvale respects your privacy. We are particularly sensitive to privacy issues on the 
Internet and therefore we provide this Privacy Policy so you know about our online 
information practices and understand how we treat the information we receive about 
you from the Internet. 

In general, you can browse our website without telling us who you are or revealing 
any personal information about yourself. We are however able to determine your IP 
address. We use your IP address to help diagnose problems with our server, to 
administer our website, to measure the use of our website and to improve the 
content of our website. In short, we use your IP to gather aggregate demographic 
information. There are a few places where we give you an opportunity to provide us 
with a small amount of personal information about yourself such as your name and 
email address. If you choose to share any personal information with us, you will see 
that the amount and type of personal information we request depend on how you use 
our website. 

We may use your personal information for particular purposes such as processing 
your order or for marketing research and other marketing purposes and for providing 
you with the latest product and promotional information and other information that 
might be useful to you. We may share this information with Canvale business 
partners to support your customer relationship with Canvale. We will not give or sell 
this information to any other company for its use in marketing or solicitation. If you 
have provided us with your personal information and do not wish to receive further 
information from Canvale, you can send us an e-mail at info@canvale.com.au.  This 
email address is being protected from spambots. You need JavaScript enabled to 
view it. This e-mail address is being protected from spambots. You need JavaScript 
enabled to view it and tell us that you do not want to receive future communications. 

Canvale website contains links to other non- Canvale websites. Canvale is not 
responsible for the privacy practices or the content of such websites and you should 
exercise your best judgement when sharing personal information on these websites. 
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We want you to have continuing trust in Canvale and in our products and services 
and, so, we have put in place reasonable physical, electronic and managerial 
procedures to safeguard and secure your personal information. 

By using this website you are agreeing to the terms of Canvale Privacy Policy. 

We reserve the right to modify our privacy policy as business needs require. We will 
post such changes on our website. 

Communications 

Canvale uses personally identifiable information for essential communications, such 
as Emails, accounts information, and critical service details. We may also use this 
information for other purposes, including some promotional Emails. If at any time a 
customer wishes not to receive such correspondence, they can request to be 
removed from any mailing lists by emailing us at info@canvale.com.au. This email 
address is being protected from spambots. You need JavaScript enabled to view it. 
You will be notified when your personal information is collected by any third party 
that is not our agent/service provider, so you can make an informed choice as to 
whether or not to share your information with that party. 

Should you require more information on any of the services available from Canvale 
or if you have any comments or ideas for the content of this site, please fill out below 
form. Alternatively please feel free to reach us by phone or email. 
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